
  BIDDERS 
NAME  

EXTENDED 
TOTAL 

LINE 
ITEM 

QTY  UOM  DESCRIPTION  

ALASKA 
SALES & SVC  

TONY CHEV 
PRIMARY  

TONY CHEV 
ALTERNATE  

CAL 
WORTHINGTON 

FORD  
  

1  1  EA  NEW (2000) 3/4 
TON 4X4 

STANDARD 
CAB PICKUP, 

SINGLE 
WHEELED.  

$20,404.00  $23,084.00  NO ALT  $24,845.30  $20,404.00  

2  1  EA  NEW (2000) 
ONE (1) TON 

4X4 STANDARD 
CAB PICKUP, 

SINGLE 
WHEELED 

WITH GLASS 
RACK 

MOUNTED 
OVER BED.  

$26,565.00  WITHDRAWN  NO ALT  $30,168.30  $26,565.00  

3  2  EA  NEW (2000) 
SINGLE 

WHEELED ONE 
(1) TON 4X4 

PLOW TRUCKS 
WITH SERVICE 

BODIES & 
PLOWS.  

NO BID  NO BID  NO ALT  $34,488.72  $68,977.44  

4  3  EA  NEW (2000) $21,959.00  $22,140.00  NO ALT  NO BID  $65,877.00  



CHEVROLET 
ASTRO ALL-

WHEEL DRIVE 
MINI CARGO 

VANS  

5  4  EA  NEW (2000) 
ONE (1) TON 
STANDARD 
CAB PLOW 

TRUCKS WITH 
PLOWS .  

NO BID  NO BID  NO ALT  $30,054.17  $120,216.68  

6  5  EA  NEW (2000) 
SUPER CARGO 

VANS  

$22,390.00  $23,823.00  $24,490.00*  $28,122.40  $111,950.00  

AWARD TOTALS PER BIDDER  $224,796.00  .00  .00  $189,194.12  $413,990.12  

*Alternate for quick delivery on three vans.  


