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TABULATION OF BIDS

Opened: 2:00 P.M. Anchorage Time Invitation: School Furniture
 April 9, 2003

VENDORS

1. Arctic Office Products 2. Corporate Express 3. Saxton Bradley
 100 W. Fireweed Ln.     4831 Old Seward Hwy.     1506 East 41st Court
 Anchorage, AK. 99503     Anchorage, AK. 99503     Anchorage, AK. 99508

LINE ITEM 
AWARD 
TOTAL

LINE QTY UNITS PRODUCT DESCRIPTION 1 2 3

1 60 EA TABLE, MOBILE AUDITERIA, VIRCO DELIVERED NO BID 527.00 NO BID 31,620.00
#MT60R001EAE DELIVERED &

INSTALLED NO BID 533.10 NO BID
2 2150 EA CHAIR, STUDENT, VIRCO #39018 DELIVERED NO BID 48.50 NO BID 104,275.00

DELIVERED &
INSTALLED NO BID 51.00 NO BID

3 340 EA CHAIR, STUDENT, MARTEST 21, DELIVERED NO BID 46.70 NO BID 15,878.00
VIRCO #3018 DELIVERED & NO BID 49.20 NO BID

INSTALLED
4 168 EA CHAIR, FOLDING, UPHOLSTERED SEAT & DELIVERED 27.25 41.50 38.50 4,578.00

BACK, KI #FRS704 DELIVERED &
INSTALLED 28.30 43.00 43.00
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5 2 EA CART, FOLDING CHAIR, STORAGE, DELIVERED 465.00 555.80 629.00 930.00
KI #KDT84 DELIVERED &

INSTALLED 490.00 557.30 639.00
6 60 EA INSTRUCTERN, TEACHER, FLEETWOOD DELIVERED 549.00 472.70 NO BID

#17-9041-311-000 DELIVERED &
INSTALLED 565.00 475.20 NO BID 28,512.00

7 20 EA TABLE, FOLDING, MITY-LITE DELIVERED 269.00 NO BID NO BID 5,380.00
#RT-3072-F DELIVERED &

INSTALLED 279.00 NO BID NO BID
8 2 EA CART, TABLE, FOLDING, STORAGE, MITY- DELIVERED 295.00 NO BID NO BID 590.00

LITE #RT-CART-EDGE-3072 DELIVERED & 320.00 NO BID NO BID
INSTALLED

9 40 EA BOOKCASE, METAL, HON #S72ABC DELIVERED 129.00 126.50 NO BID
DELIVERED &
INSTALLED 139.00 129.00 NO BID 5,160.00

10 700 EA CHAIR, AUDITERIA, FALCON #H101 DELIVERED 82.00 83.70 NO BID 57,400.00
DELIVERED &
INSTALLED 87.00 85.20 NO BID

11 20 EA CART, CHAIR, STORAGE, FALCON #HD1 DELIVERED 173.00 187.10 NO BID 3,460.00
DELIVERED & 180.00 188.60 NO BID
INSTALLED
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12 45 EA CABINET, LATERAL FILE, 4 DRAWER, HON DELIVERED 477.00 478.50 NO BID
#794L-V DELIVERED &

INSTALLED 489.00 481.00 NO BID 21,645.00
13 30 EA CABINET, VERTICAL FILE, 4 DRAWER, HON DELIVERED 163.00 162.90 NO BID

#314P-V DELIVERED &
INSTALLED 173.00 165.40 NO BID 4,962.00

14 20 EA CABINET, VERTICAL FILE, 2 DRAWER, HON DELIVERED 114.00 113.80 NO BID 2,276.00
#312P-V DELIVERED &

INSTALLED 124.00 116.30 NO BID
15 100 EA CHAIR, WOOD, LIBRARY, COMMUNITY DELIVERED 128.00 140.20 NO BID 12,800.00

SEATING #59A-MCM DELIVERED &
INSTALLED 135.00 142.70 NO BID

16 14 EA TABLE, LIBRARY, 90X36X29, COMMUNITY DELIVERED 555.00 651.00 NO BID
SEATING #LI3690-MCM-B DELIVERED &

INSTALLED 570.00 661.20 NO BID 7,980.00
17 5 EA TABLE, LIBRARY, 60X36X29, COMMUNITY DELIVERED 385.00 442.70 NO BID

SEATING #LI3660-MCM-B DELIVERED &
INSTALLED 400.00 452.90 NO BID 2,000.00

18 21 EA CHAIR, STAFF LOUNGE, KI # MATRIX - DELIVERED 74.00 70.70 95.25 1,484.70
MX/TD/BS DELIVERED &

INSTALLED 79.00 72.20 100.25
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19 2 EA SOFA, STAFF LOUNGE, CORIANDER DELIVERED 1109.00 1183.10 1255.00
 #9030-3 DELIVERED &

INSTALLED 1139.00 1185.60 1275.00 2,278.00
20 39 EA CHAIR, CONFERENCE ROOM, CORIANDER DELIVERED 340.00 290.80 315.00

#9020 WITH ARMS DELIVERED &
INSTALLED 350.00 293.30 325.00 11,438.70

21 100 EA CHAIR, TEACHER, HON #7702 DELIVERED 138.00 177.90 NO BID
DELIVERED &
INSTALLED 149.00 185.60 NO BID 14,900.00

22 32 EA CHAIR, ADIMINSTRATION TASK, SUPERIOR DELIVERED 275.00 NO BID 255.00
#20240222074/1984 DELIVERED &

INSTALLED 285.00 NO BID 270.00 8,640.00
23 64 EA CHAIR, GUEST, SUPERIOR #203202222096 DELIVERED 170.00 NO BID 156.00 9,984.00

DELIVERED &
INSTALLED 176.00 NO BID 167.00
TOTAL 
AWARD
BY VENDOR $112,296.00 $227,251.40 $18,624.00 


